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Bid Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1 REMOVE END OF ROAD MARKER 6 EA 102.51 615.06 30.00 180.00 180.00 1,080.00 80.00 480.00

2 REMOVE CONCRETE HEADER 53 LF 13.76 729.28 14.75 781.75 7.00 371.00 10.00 530.00

3 CONSTRUCT 7" CONCRETE PAVEMENT (TYPE L65 W/ INTEGRAL CURB) 54,419 SY 49.08 2,670,884.52 52.90 2,878,765.10 47.00 2,557,693.00 50.00 2,720,950.00

4 SUBGRADE PREPARATION 18,140 CY 4.52 81,992.80 11.85 214,959.00 10.20 185,028.00 3.75 68,025.00

5 TIE BARS 12 EA 26.78 321.36 10.85 130.20 20.00 240.00 8.00 96.00

6 EXCAVATION ON-SITE (ESTABLISHED QUANTITIY) 5,000 CY ---- ---- ---- ---- ---- ---- ---- ----

7 ADJUST MANHOLE TO GRADE 76 EA 491.32 37,340.32 281.20 21,371.20 49.00 3,724.00 250.00 19,000.00

8 DUAL 6'-0" x 6'-0" BOX CULVERT 70 LF ---- ---- ---- ---- 3,100.00 217,000.00 ---- ----

9 7'-0" x 8'-0" BOX CULVERT 127 LF ---- ---- ---- ---- 2,500.00 317,500.00 ---- ----

10 DUAL 10'-0" x 6'-0" BOX CULVERT 54 LF ---- ---- ---- ---- 4,700.00 253,800.00 ---- ----

11 CONSTRUCT 18" RCP, CLASS III 5,691 LF 62.71 356,882.61 63.20 359,671.20 77.00 438,207.00 55.77 317,387.07

12 CONSTRUCT 24" RCP, CLASS III 742 LF 80.54 59,760.68 80.00 59,360.00 99.00 73,458.00 77.63 57,601.46

13 CONSTRUCT 30" RCP, CLASS III 1,514 LF 104.37 158,016.18 108.80 164,723.20 135.00 204,390.00 97.06 146,948.84

14 CONSTRUCT 36" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 2,955 LF 131.98 390,000.90 140.60 415,473.00 176.00 520,080.00 128.37 379,333.35

15 CONSTRUCT 42" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 260 LF 178.82 46,493.20 200.30 52,078.00 213.00 55,380.00 180.66 46,971.60

16 CONSTRUCT 48" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 260 LF 210.20 54,652.00 231.50 60,190.00 257.00 66,820.00 204.39 53,141.40

17 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET - TYPE I 55 EA 5,373.00 295,515.00 4,873.50 268,042.50 4,730.00 260,150.00 4,950.00 272,250.00

18 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET - TYPE III 28 EA 5,799.20 162,377.60 5,545.00 155,260.00 4,540.00 127,120.00 5,000.00 140,000.00

19 CONSTRUCT 54" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (15) 120 VF 1,030.87 123,704.40 893.80 107,256.00 900.00 108,000.00 809.05 97,086.00

20 CONSTRUCT 60" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (15) 115 VF 1,187.44 136,555.60 1,078.10 123,981.50 1,000.00 115,000.00 930.57 107,015.55

21 CONSTRUCT 72" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (1) 12 VF 1,226.37 14,716.44 1,061.20 12,734.40 1,100.00 13,200.00 1,010.54 12,126.48

22 CONSTRUCT 60" AREA INLET - TYPE II 17 VF 1,272.19 21,627.23 1,229.40 20,899.80 900.00 15,300.00 1,005.35 17,090.95

23 CONSTRUCT 18" RC FLARED END SECTION 4 EA 1,334.79 5,339.16 951.70 3,806.80 2,450.00 9,800.00 1,215.14 4,860.56

24 CONSTRUCT 24" RC FLARED END SECTION 4 EA 1,536.04 6,144.16 1,289.20 5,156.80 2,550.00 10,200.00 1,406.24 5,624.96

25 CONSTRUCT 30" RC FLARED END SECTION 3 EA 1,850.64 5,551.92 1,510.10 4,530.30 2,800.00 8,400.00 1,619.15 4,857.45

26 CONSTRUCT 42" RC FLARED END SECTION 2 EA 3,043.33 6,086.66 2,697.30 5,394.60 3,400.00 6,800.00 2,583.99 5,167.98

27 CONSTRUCT 48" RC FLARED END SECTION 2 EA 3,434.33 6,868.66 3,212.10 6,424.20 4,030.00 8,060.00 2,908.03 5,816.06

28 CONSTRUCT 30" PIPE PLUG 1 EA 1,017.55 1,017.55 686.50 686.50 1,870.00 1,870.00 616.92 616.92

29 INSTALL PIPE COUPLERS 42 EA 134.36 5,643.12 114.60 4,813.20 350.00 14,700.00 175.52 7,371.84

30 CONSTRUCT TYPE B RIP-RAP 425 TN 93.12 39,576.00 93.65 39,801.25 87.00 36,975.00 29.08 12,359.00

Luxa Construction 
925 E Dixon Road

Blair, NE 68008

RPL Utility, LLC
36233 Rosewood Road

Miden, IA 51553

Chas. Vrana & Son Construction 
4816 F Street 

Omaha, NE 68117

TAB Construction Co. 
4153 S 67th Street
Omaha, NE 68117

E & A Consulting Group, Inc. 
10909 Mill Valley Road, Ste 100
Omaha, NE 68154
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31 CONSTRUCT STREET NAME SIGN 44 EA 112.75 4,961.00 326.00 14,344.00 109.00 4,796.00 100.00 4,400.00

32 CONSTRUCT SIGN POST 22 EA 108.75 2,392.50 189.70 4,173.40 105.00 2,310.00 100.00 2,200.00

33 INSTALL SEEDING - TYPE A 2,500 SY 0.65 1,625.00 0.70 1,750.00 0.54 1,350.00 0.62 1,550.00

34 INSTALL EROSION CONTROL MATTING 2,500 SY 1.30 3,250.00 1.40 3,500.00 1.51 3,775.00 1.25 3,125.00

35 INSTALL SILT FENCE 985 LF 3.02 2,974.70 3.30 3,250.50 3.20 3,152.00 3.12 3,073.20

36 JET EXISTING SANITARY SEWER 16,166 LF 0.87 14,064.42 0.95 15,357.70 1.35 21,824.10 0.68 10,992.88

37 PROVIDE TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LS 3,472.00 3,472.00 4,148.70 4,148.70 5,500.00 5,500.00 1,500.00 1,500.00

38 REMOVE BARRICADE 2 EA 512.54 1,025.08 87.70 175.40 530.00 1,060.00 150.00 300.00

39 CONSTRUCT 7" PCC MEDIAN SURFACING 704 SF 18.08 12,728.32 16.35 11,510.40 18.00 12,672.00 10.00 7,040.00

40 INSTALL PERMANENT PAINT MARKING - 5" WHITE 100 LF 6.69 669.00 23.65 2,365.00 6.50 650.00 6.50 650.00

41 CONSTRUCT END OF ROAD MARKER 3 EA 482.83 1,448.49 326.00 978.00 470.00 1,410.00 475.00 1,425.00

42 WROUGHT IRON FENCE 313 LF 211.80 66,293.40 119.30 37,340.90 111.00 34,743.00 155.79 48,762.27

43 STAIN & SEAL 7,965 SF 2.70 21,505.50 7.85 62,525.25 4.80 38,232.00 5.56 44,285.40

44 WINGWALLS/ HEADWALLS - LINCOLN BOULEVARD 1 LS 292,780.50 292,780.50 288,735.00 288,735.00 275,000.00 275,000.00 375,000.00 375,000.00

45 WINGWALLS/ HEADWALLS - BUCHANAN PARKWAY 1 LS 64,873.10 64,873.10 50,212.00 50,212.00 40,000.00 40,000.00 77,893.56 77,893.56

46 WINGWALLS/ HEADWALLS - 218TH STREET 1 LS 127,671.63 127,671.63 112,705.00 112,705.00 130,000.00 130,000.00 310,000.00 310,000.00

47 CONSTRUCT 72" AREA INLET - TYPE II 22 VF 1,710.32 37,627.04 1,467.20 32,278.40 1,170.00 25,740.00 1,221.37 26,870.14

48 REMOVE SURCHARGE 14,517 CY 4.24 61,552.08 4.15 60,245.55 2.50 36,292.50 4.15 60,245.55

49 REMOVE 36" CGMP 207 LF 30.00 6,210.00 27.15 5,620.05 15.00 3,105.00 14.54 3,009.78

50 REMOVE 48" CGMP 108 LF 35.51 3,835.08 34.55 3,731.40 29.00 3,132.00 16.62 1,794.96

51 REMOVE 60” CGMP 112 LF 55.45 6,210.40 61.90 6,932.80 31.00 3,472.00 20.77 2,326.24

52 SAW CUT 213 LF 6.11 1,301.43 7.50 1,597.50 6.00 1,278.00 5.19 1,105.47

53 CONSTRUCT PRECAST WINGWALLS – BUCHANAN PARKWAY 1 LS ---- ---- ---- ---- ---- ---- ---- ----

54 DUAL 10’-0” X 6’-0” PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT 54 LF 3,189.07 172,209.78 2,458.70 132,769.80 ---- ---- 4,933.26 266,396.04

55 7’-0” X 8’-0” BOX PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT 127 LF 1,346.52 171,008.04 1,027.50 130,492.50 ---- ---- 1,973.30 250,609.10

56 DUAL 6’-0” X 6’-0” PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT 70 LF 2,411.54 168,807.80 1,603.90 112,273.00 ---- ---- 3,219.60 225,372.00

57 CONSTRUCT TEMPORARY 36” CMP 207 LF 145.51 30,120.57 151.20 31,298.40 120.00 24,840.00 67.51 13,974.57

58 CONSTRUCT TEMPORARY 48” CMP 108 LF 238.92 25,803.36 264.10 28,522.80 205.00 22,140.00 124.63 13,460.04

59 CONSTRUCT TEMPORARY 60” CMP 112 LF 360.91 40,421.92 400.30 44,833.60 305.00 34,160.00 259.65 29,080.80

60 CONSTRUCT SURCHARGE OVER BOX CULVERT 14,517 CY 4.24 61,552.08 4.75 68,955.75 2.50 36,292.50 4.67 67,794.39

61 GRADING ROAD OVER CULVERT 24,580 CY 5.21 128,061.80 5.95 146,251.00 2.50 61,450.00 5.71 140,351.80

NO BID NO BID $6,458,722.10 NO BID

$6,224,868.43 $6,405,344.30 NO BID $6,497,296.66

E & A Consulting Group, Inc. 
10909 Mill Valley Road, Ste 100
Omaha, NE 68154

TOTAL BASE BID (ITEMS 1 - 52 & 57 - 61, INCLUSIVE)

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID (ITEMS 1 - 7, 11 - 61, INCLUSIVE)
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Bid Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1 REMOVE END OF ROAD MARKER 6 EA 51.52 309.12 41.30 247.80 

2 REMOVE CONCRETE HEADER 53 LF 11.59 614.27 7.67 406.51 

3 CONSTRUCT 7" CONCRETE PAVEMENT (TYPE L65 W/ INTEGRAL CURB) 54,419 SY 51.61 2,808,564.59 54.80 2,982,161.20 

4 SUBGRADE PREPARATION 18,140 CY 3.95 71,653.00 6.00 108,840.00 

5 TIE BARS 12 EA 8.45 101.40 7.55 90.60 

6 EXCAVATION ON-SITE (ESTABLISHED QUANTITIY) 5,000 CY ---- ---- ---- ----

7 ADJUST MANHOLE TO GRADE 76 EA 223.99 17,023.24 792.81 60,253.56 

8 DUAL 6'-0" x 6'-0" BOX CULVERT 70 LF ---- ---- 3,699.95 258,996.50 

9 7'-0" x 8'-0" BOX CULVERT 127 LF ---- ---- 2,504.94 318,127.38 

10 DUAL 10'-0" x 6'-0" BOX CULVERT 54 LF ---- ---- 5,985.35 323,208.90 

11 CONSTRUCT 18" RCP, CLASS III 5,691 LF 57.92 329,622.72 85.32 485,556.12 

12 CONSTRUCT 24" RCP, CLASS III 742 LF 79.87 59,263.54 115.56 85,745.52 

13 CONSTRUCT 30" RCP, CLASS III 1,514 LF 112.23 169,916.22 157.68 238,727.52 

14 CONSTRUCT 36" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 2,955 LF 153.50 453,592.50 198.72 587,217.60 

15 CONSTRUCT 42" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 260 LF 202.03 52,527.80 275.40 71,604.00 

16 CONSTRUCT 48" RCP, D(0.01)=1,350 260 LF 241.05 62,673.00 315.36 81,993.60 

17 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET - TYPE I 55 EA 4,891.48 269,031.40 4,616.23 253,892.65 

18 CONSTRUCT CURB INLET - TYPE III 28 EA 5,778.74 161,804.72 7,074.06 198,073.68 

19 CONSTRUCT 54" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (15) 120 VF 1,005.91 120,709.20 991.44 118,972.80 

20 CONSTRUCT 60" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (15) 115 VF 1,015.44 116,775.60 1,196.64 137,613.60 

21 CONSTRUCT 72" I.D. STORM MANHOLE (FLAT TOP) (1) 12 VF 1,068.06 12,816.72 1,345.68 16,148.16 

22 CONSTRUCT 60" AREA INLET - TYPE II 17 VF 983.52 16,719.84 1,236.60 21,022.20 

23 CONSTRUCT 18" RC FLARED END SECTION 4 EA 1,353.84 5,415.36 1,270.08 5,080.32 

24 CONSTRUCT 24" RC FLARED END SECTION 4 EA 1,824.82 7,299.28 1,609.20 6,436.80 

25 CONSTRUCT 30" RC FLARED END SECTION 3 EA 1,943.93 5,831.79 1,777.68 5,333.04 

26 CONSTRUCT 42" RC FLARED END SECTION 2 EA 3,240.08 6,480.16 3,263.76 6,527.52 

27 CONSTRUCT 48" RC FLARED END SECTION 2 EA 3,830.00 7,660.00 3,841.56 7,683.12 

28 CONSTRUCT 30" PIPE PLUG 1 EA 1,035.04 1,035.04 1,650.24 1,650.24 

29 INSTALL PIPE COUPLERS 42 EA 108.71 4,565.82 213.84 8,981.28 

30 CONSTRUCT TYPE B RIP-RAP 425 TN 97.88 41,599.00 127.44 54,162.00 

Valley Corporation 
P.O. Box 589

Valley, NE 68064

MBC Construction
6002 N 89th Circle 
Omaha, NE 68134

E & A Consulting Group, Inc. 
10909 Mill Valley Road, Ste 100
Omaha, NE 68154
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31 CONSTRUCT STREET NAME SIGN 44 EA 121.79 5,358.76 112.23 4,938.12 

32 CONSTRUCT SIGN POST 22 EA 117.47 2,584.34 108.25 2,381.50 

33 INSTALL SEEDING - TYPE A 2,500 SY 0.70 1,750.00 0.66 1,650.00 

34 INSTALL EROSION CONTROL MATTING 2,500 SY 1.41 3,525.00 1.32 3,300.00 

35 INSTALL SILT FENCE 985 LF 3.21 3,161.85 2.86 2,817.10 

36 JET EXISTING SANITARY SEWER 16,166 LF 0.82 13,256.12 0.76 12,286.16 

37 PROVIDE TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 LS 1,757.99 1,757.99 3,780.00 3,780.00 

38 REMOVE BARRICADE 2 EA 244.72 489.44 413.00 826.00 

39 CONSTRUCT 7" PCC MEDIAN SURFACING 704 SF 9.20 6,476.80 6.06 4,266.24 

40 INSTALL PERMANENT PAINT MARKING - 5" WHITE 100 LF 7.23 723.00 7.00 700.00 

41 CONSTRUCT END OF ROAD MARKER 3 EA 186.76 560.28 480.60 1,441.80 

42 WROUGHT IRON FENCE 313 LF 234.40 73,367.20 245.16 76,735.08 

43 STAIN & SEAL 7,965 SF 5.33 42,453.45 6.37 50,737.05 

44 WINGWALLS/ HEADWALLS - LINCOLN BOULEVARD 1 LS 510,581.73 510,581.73 1,264,460.33 1,264,460.33 

45 WINGWALLS/ HEADWALLS - BUCHANAN PARKWAY 1 LS 136,870.77 136,870.77 85,697.78 85,697.78 

46 WINGWALLS/ HEADWALLS - 218TH STREET 1 LS 257,967.22 257,967.22 639,159.20 639,159.20 

47 CONSTRUCT 72" AREA INLET - TYPE II 22 VF 1,385.95 30,490.90 433.16 9,529.52 

48 REMOVE SURCHARGE 14,517 CY 3.04 44,131.68 11.88 172,461.96 

49 REMOVE 36" CGMP 207 LF 31.86 6,595.02 22.68 4,694.76 

50 REMOVE 48" CGMP 108 LF 40.22 4,343.76 22.68 2,449.44 

51 REMOVE 60” CGMP 112 LF 53.98 6,045.76 22.68 2,540.16 

52 SAW CUT 213 LF 5.86 1,248.18 5.50 1,171.50 

53 CONSTRUCT PRECAST WINGWALLS – BUCHANAN PARKWAY 1 LS ---- ---- ---- ----

54 DUAL 10’-0” X 6’-0” PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT 54 LF 4,001.31 216,070.74 6,376.90 344,352.60 

55 7’-0” X 8’-0” BOX PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT 127 LF 2,508.59 318,590.93 2,522.78 320,393.06 

56 DUAL 6’-0” X 6’-0” PRECAST CONCRETE BOX CULVERT 70 LF 3,665.56 256,589.20 4,145.19 290,163.30 

57 CONSTRUCT TEMPORARY 36” CMP 207 LF 111.30 23,039.10 189.00 39,123.00 

58 CONSTRUCT TEMPORARY 48” CMP 108 LF 187.17 20,214.36 293.76 31,726.08 

59 CONSTRUCT TEMPORARY 60” CMP 112 LF 285.18 31,940.16 434.16 48,625.92 

60 CONSTRUCT SURCHARGE OVER BOX CULVERT 14,517 CY 3.23 46,889.91 11.88 172,461.96 

61 GRADING ROAD OVER CULVERT 24,580 CY 3.59 88,242.20 9.72 238,917.60 

NO BID $9,323,632.48

$6,958,921.18 $9,378,208.66

E & A Consulting Group, Inc. 
10909 Mill Valley Road, Ste 100
Omaha, NE 68154

TOTAL BASE BID (ITEMS 1 - 52 & 57 - 61, INCLUSIVE)

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID (ITEMS 1 - 7, 11 - 61, INCLUSIVE)


